CONTRACT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

THIS AGREEMENT is made and entered into this September 2, 2014 by
and between the City of Aventura, a Florida Municipal Corporation (“CITY™), and
Ronald L. Book, Esg. (“BOOK"), an attorney and member of the Florida Bar,
doing business as Ronald L. Book, P.A.

THE PARTIES HERETO DO COVENANT AND AGREE AS FOLLOWS:

I PURPOSE

The purpose of this Agreement is to provide for the CITY to retain
the professional services of BOOK for coordination of the CITY'S legislative
relations and for lobbying requirements, as described in paragraph Il herein
below.

. SERVICES

Book shall provide all necessary legislative relations and lobbying
services to the City of Aventura. Such services shall include work for the
purpose of securing funds and grants for various purposes from State, County,
Federal and other sources, promoting intergovernmental cooperation in
achieving the CITY'S objectives, and securing funds and grants for parks and
recreation purposes, drainage improvements, crime prevention, economic
development, and other purposes. BOOK shall regularly report the status of his
efforts to the City Manager and/or the City Attorney.

lll. COMPENSATION

A. For all professional services by BOOK hereunder as

described in paragraph I, the CITY shall pay BOOK annual compensation of



Fifty Two Thousand and Five Hundred ($52,500.00) DoII‘ars, payable in equal
monthly installments on or before the 20 day of each month of the term hereof.

B. In the event that an extraordinary matter arises hereunder
which itself substantially consumes the time, effort and resources otherwise
available, the CITY may, at the City Commission’s discretion, provide additional
reasonable compensation to BOOK.

IV. EFFECTIVE DATE/DURATION

This Agreement shall be effective immediately upon execution by
both parties and shall be terminated in accordance with Section V.
V.  TERMINATION
Either party hereto, at its discretion, may terminate this contract at
any time, upon thirty (30) days advance written notice to the other. In the event
of such termination, the City shall only be obligated for costs incurred prior to the
termination notice.
V. PRIORITY
BOOK shall not be prohibited from representing or providing the
like services to other persons and entities beside CITY, so long as BOOK shall
avoid any representation or relation which would create an adversarial (litigation
against the City) conflict of interest, as determined by the City Attorney and City
Commission. Further, BOOK shalil not take on any client or matter which would
jeopardize BOOK'S ability to devote the time, resources and effort necessary to

fulfill his obligations to CITY hereunder.



VIl. MALPRACTICE INSURANCE
BOOK shall carry lawyer's professional malpractice insurance or
other form of insurance which shall provide coverage of not less than $500,000.

Vill. PROCESSING OF COSTS

BOOK shall be reimbursed by CITY for reasonable costs, including
travel expenses, telephone, copying fees, federal express and postage, unless
paid in advance by the CITY. Such costs shall not exceed Five Thousand
($5,000.00) Dollars on an annual basis, between the City and Book, unless
approved by the City Manager. |f BOOK is traveling on behalf of several clients,
the City shall be responsible for such costs on a pro-rated and equal basis.

IX. NOT ASSIGNABLE

This Agreement shall not be subject to assignment by either party
hereto.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF the undersigned parties have executed this

Agreement on the date indicated above.

WITNESSED: RONALD L. BOOK, PA.
— é CJaC
Zéen&w'&vg/ F/"ISI_'US CITTIF?!;A/

Eric M. Sorokh, City flanager

APPROVED AS TO LEGAL FORM-AND SUFFICIENCY:

7 o Ll

City Attorney o




From: Kelly Mallette

To: Lobbyist Disclosure
Subject: RE: Expired Public Contract
Date: Thursday, May 13, 2021 1:07:42 PM

EXTERNAL EMAIL: This email originated from outside of the Legislature. USE CAUTION when clicking links or
opening attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Jonathan,

There are no renewal letters as the contract automatically renews and includes a 30-day termination
clause. The compensation included in the contract has not changed. Please let me know if you need
additional information.

Let me know if you need anything else. Thank you,
Kelly

Kelly C. Mallette

Ronald L. Book, P.A.
Office: (305) 935-1866
Cell: (786) 295-1199
Tallahassee: (850) 224-3427

From: Lobbyist Disclosure <LobbyistDisclosure@myfloridahouse.gov>
Sent: Thursday, May 13, 2021 12:47 PM

To: Kelly Mallette <Kelly@rlbookpa.com>

Subject: RE: Expired Public Contract

Good afternoon, Kelly.

Thank you for your response. Reviewing your contract it appears to have begun in 2014 with no
termination date. Is this correct? Is this contract still valid? Are there any renewal letters for this
contract?

Thanks again for your help in keeping our database up to date.

Jonathan

Jonathan Helle

Florida House of Representatives
Public Integrity & Elections

Main Office - 850-717-4881
Direct Office - 850-717-5537
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